
 
 
 

BUSA Elections 2024-25 
Candidate List – Executive Committee 

Nominee Details in alphabetical order per position 

FOR PRESIDENT 

 

Elijah Sargent 

 

Hi Bondies! I’m Elijah Sargent, and after serving for a year as 
your Vice President of Recreation, I have nominated to continue 
serving the student community as President of the Bond 
University Student Association. My time spent as Vice President 
of Recreation and as Co-Convenor of Bondstock 2024 has 
extended my passion for leadership and deepened my 
understanding of student needs and interests. With your trust, I 
hope to build on BUSA’s relationship with the students to ensure 
every voice is heard. Thank you for your continued support – 
let’s work together to create a vibrant and inclusive student 
community. 

 

Timothy Palmer 

  

 

Hi Bondies, my name is Timothy Palmer and I am nominating 
for the position of President of BUSA for the 2024/25 committee. 
I am currently studying a Bachelor of Laws/Commerce for the 
past two years and have loved the community it has provided. I 
have been greatly involved over those years and want to 
continue to push Bond forward in what it provides to you. I 
would love to see BUSA empower the other clubs that make 
Bond such a great community and I think my experiences will be 
a great way to revitalise BUSA to achieve this  

FOR TREASURER 

 

Keerat Sidhu 

 

 

Hey Bondies! As your Treasurer, I’m dedicated to making every 
dollar work hard to elevate your campus experience! 

With a proven track record in budgeting and financial 
management, I’ll ensure that your favorite clubs, events, and 
initiatives receive the funding they deserve. By collaborating 
with student leaders and university staff, I’ll keep everything 
running smoothly so you can enjoy all the incredible 
opportunities Bond offers. 

Let’s build a vibrant, inclusive community that highlights what 
makes Bond University truly special. 
 



 
 

 

Michael Ting  

 

 

Hi Bondies!  

My name is Michael and I am running for the position of 
Treasurer of Busa for the 24/25 committee. I am currently going 
into my sixth semester studying law and Commerce. Throughout 
my studies I have loved the culture here at Bond and being a 
part of the community, being blessed with many great 
experiences. Upon being a part of a number of student 
committees in the past couple years, I would love to continue to 
push for more opportunities for all students at the University and 
to give back to the community.  

FOR SECRETARY 

 

Jett-Paris Bedelis 

 

Hey everyone! My name is Jett and I am excited about the 
possibility to serve each and every one of you as secretary of 
BUSA. With a passion toward fostering an inclusive and 
cohesive environment, I aim to ensure that all students feel 
empowered to have a voice within the Bond University 
community. Currently working in a managerial role with a 
background in competitive sports and captaincy during 
highschool, I believe I have what it takes to make BUSA great 
again! 

 

Jordan Shephard 

 

 

Hi Bondies! I’m Jordi, a penultimate year studying 
Law/Business. I am the current President of the Business 
Students’ Association (BSA), and organising events like Palaver 
has enhanced my passion for student life at Bond.  

Outside of the office, I love cheerleading - as Vice President of 
the Bond Cheer Club, I understand the importance of good 
teamwork! As your Secretary, I would bring energy, dedication, 
and a love for student involvement to the role.  

Go Bullsharks! 

FOR VICE PRESIDENT RECREATION 

  

FOR VICE PRESIDENT EDUCATION 



 
 

 

Hoda Asgarian  

 

As a PhD student with nearly two years of student leadership 
experience, I am dedicated to enhancing the academic journey 
for all students. Serving as the Research Management Group 
(RMG) Representative, student leader, and educator, I have 
fostered collaboration among peers and HDR students to 
support learning and organize initiatives centered on 
international student interests in the Law faculty. As Vice 
President of Education, I aim to promote inclusive learning, 
advocate for academic resources, and ensure student voices 
are heard. My passion lies in empowering students to achieve 
academic and personal success  

 

Annie Bui  

 

As a candidate for Vice President of Education, I aim to 
transform student learning experiences by advocating for 
student needs. With an understanding of academic policy, I will 
make sure that student voices shape curriculum and policy 
decisions. My experience in collaborative leadership will 
improve student representation at the Academic Senate and 
contribute to achieving goals. I am dedicated to fostering 
inclusive and innovative initiatives for domestic, international 
and postgraduate students. My administrative and 
communication skills will be instrumental for stakeholders at all 
levels. I am committed to upholding high curriculum standards 
and creating meaningful change, supporting student interests 
with integrity.  

 

Indigo Cheetham  

 

Hi! I’m Indigo, running for Vice President (Education).   

I am passionate about ensuring every student is heard and 
supported. As Academic Affairs Director on my faculty’s student 
association, I made practical change and represented students 
in various capacities. From my experience, I truly understand 
this role and the wonderful people surrounding it.   

This role is about us - the students. I hear you asking for fairer 
marking criteria across faculties, more consistency and access 
to support, and a wider range of academic co-curriculars. I care 
deeply about your experience and look forward to advocating for 
you everywhere I can.  

FOR VICE PRESIDENT SPORT 



 
 

 

Nicholas Spegel  

 
 

As President of the Bond Basketball Club, Men’s Captain of 
Bond UniSports, and a staff member at the Bond University 
Sports Centre, I am deeply involved in our sporting community. 
I’ve developed strong leadership and communication skills with 
Bond Sport while helping to organise and promote sports on 
campus. My studies in Law and Business allow me to manage 
this role’s responsibilities. I’m passionate about creating more 
sporting opportunities and ensuring everyone, from beginners to 
athletes, feels included and encouraged to participate. As Vice-
President of Sport, I’ll work to make the sporting community 
more vibrant and accessible for all Bondies.  

FOR VICE PRESIDENT COMMUNICATION 

 

Noah Tye  

 
 

Hello Bondies!  

I’m Noah Tye, and I’m thrilled to be your candidate for VP 
Communications for the 2024/25 Executive Committee of the 
Bond University Student Association. I’m studying 
Communications, serving as a student ambassador, and have 
worked with the marketing team on Bond University’s TikTok.  

 I value communication deeply. I’ve built a large TikTok following 
and collaborated with brands like City Beach Australia so I 
understand engagement.  

 I would be honoured to apply the knowledge I’ve gained to 
foster connection and keep you informed about all the fantastic 
events and opportunities Bond offers. I aim to create eye-
catching, informative, and accessible content for BUSA’s social 
media platforms. As VP of Communications, I aim to nurture a 
supportive environment and strengthen the Association and 
community at bond.  

 Thank you in advance for your trust and support. I look forward 
to working with you all soon!  

FOR VICE PRESIDENT REPRESENTATION 

  

 


